
 

 

 
Multiple Tenure-Track Faculty Positions 

Department of Physiology and Pharmacology at the University of Toledo 
College of Medicine and Life Sciences 

 
The University of Toledo College of Medicine and Life Sciences has designed and recently 
implemented an innovative and clinically integrated foundational science curriculum. This 18 
month curriculum is organized into four curricular threads and requires active participation of 
foundational and clinical faculty working collaboratively across the integrated threads to deliver 
medical student education.  

In collaboration with the Department of Medical Education, the Department of Physiology & 
Pharmacology is currently recruiting tenure-track faculty positions at the rank of Assistant or 
Associate Professor. The ideal candidate will be a multidiscipline educator with a primary 
responsibility to take a leadership role in leading the horizontal and vertical integration of the 
Physiology & Pharmacology curriculum at UTCOM.  Additional information about the 
Department can be found at the following website: 
https://www.utoledo.edu/med/depts/physpharm/index.html.  

The successful candidate must possess a Ph.D. in a related field and/or one of the following:  
M.D., D.O., or the equivalent.  Previous or established experience teaching in a medical school 
environment is preferred with the ability to organize a curriculum related to physiology and 
pharmacology for medical students.  This person will have strong interpersonal skills to 
motivate, encourage and lead faculty as a system or thread director.  Expertise and interest in 
cardiopulmonary and renal systems physiology/pharmacology is preferred.  Knowledge and/or 
understanding of LCME core competencies, is desirable.   

The University of Toledo offers competitive salaries, and excellent retirement options.  The city 
of Toledo is within the Northwest Ohio region, which has very reasonable housing and living 
costs and excellent school districts. Applicants should submit curriculum vitae and names of 
three referees to https://jobs.utoledo.edu/applicants/jsp/shared/Welcome_css.jsp  (posting 
number 0600434). Questions can be directed to Dr. Bina Joe at Bina.Joe@utoledo.edu or Dr. 
Imran Ali at Imran.Ali@utoledo.edu .  Applications will be considered until the positions are 
filled. The University of Toledo is an equal access, equal opportunity, affirmative action 
employer and educator. 
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