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The purpose of the Kohler International Travel Grant report is to demonstrate and document that 
scarce university resources were invested wisely and to justify the continuation of the Kohler 
International Travel Grant Program. Vague or conclusory statements or humorous anecdotes will 
not satisfy either goal. If possible, there should be clear quantitative or qualitative measurements 
demonstrating the value of the grant and the impact on the UT community stated in the report. If 
relevant, the report should also state post-sponsored event activities, such as planned changes in 
possible curriculum, class coverage, presentations to students, colleagues, or community groups, 
should be included in the report. The number of students impacted by the activity. Also, please 
include copies of any media coverage or blogs. Links are sufficient. If the application listed in 
part student recruiting or developing professional relationships, please discuss these topics in 
your report. Not all of these items will apply to every grant or report. But, please write a detailed 
report demonstrating that the Kohler International Travel grant was a reasonable use of resources 
that positively impacted the UT community, if possible. Finally, the Committee may consider the 
grant report and the impact of prior awards as documented in the grant report in awarding future 
grants. 

If possible, the report should demonstrate that the Kohler grant and the University of Toledo 
were acknowledged in the sponsored activity, for example in the author's footnote in a 
conference paper, on a poster, on the PowerPoint slides for a presentation, or in the program for a 
performance. These are only a few examples exactly how to acknowledge the Kohler grant and 
the University of Toledo is mainly in the discretion of the grantee. 

Upon completion of the sponsored activity. The grantee must file a Kohler International Travel 
Grant Report. Failure to file a timely report will result in future grants being denied. If possible, 
there should be clear quantitative or qualitative measurements of the impact of the award. 
The report should explain how the sponsored activity: 

1) raised the profile of UT faculty in international communities; 

2) promoted UT's international and study abroad programs by establishing or deepening 
connections with international organizations or partners; 

3) supported research or teaching projects on topics related to 1 or 2 where international travel is 
required; or 

4) supported other goals or objectives identified in the 2017-2022 Strategic Plan, if possible, cite 
to or otherwise indicate which goals or objectives and briefly state how the grant-supported 
them.  


